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On May 11, 1997, at 1021 central daylight time, Continental Airlines flight 1760, a Boeing 737-524, landed at the wrong airport 
near Corpus Christi, Texas. The 5 crew members and 49 passengers were not injured. The aircraft was being operated as a 
scheduled domestic passenger flight under the provisions of Title 14 CFR Part 121. Visual meteorological conditions existed at 
the time, and an instrument flight plan was on file for the flight. The flight departed Houston, Texas, about 0932, with a 
destination of Corpus Christi International Airport (CRP), Corpus Christi, Texas. 
 
The flight crew reported to the NTSB investigator-in-charge that the First Officer had completed the ground and simulator 
difference training for the Boeing 737-300/500 series aircraft, and Continental Flight 203 from Newark International Airport 
(EWR), Newark, New Jersey, to (George Bush) Houston Intercontinental Airport (IAH), Houston, Texas, was the first flight of his 
initial operating experience (IOE) for differences training in the aircraft. The Captain was the check airman conducting the 
training. It was decided that the Captain would fly this first leg so the First Officer "could get adjusted to the 737-300 cockpit's 
normal routine since he hadn't actually flown for about three weeks." The First Officer was then to fly the second leg from 
Houston to Corpus Christi International Airport (CRP), Corpus Christi, Texas. The First Officer mentioned to the Captain that he 
had never been to that airport and the Captain said the last time he "had been in there was a little over three years ago." 
 
The flight to Houston was normal with "time en route spent going over automation philosophy, capabilities of the aircraft, and 
general techniques for using the FMC (flight management computer)." At Houston, the flight crew changed aircraft from the 
737-300 to a 737-500 series aircraft which is equipped with an EFIS (electronic flight instrument system) cockpit configuration. 
 
The takeoff and climb out from Houston was normal, but "very quick due to a relatively light load," and the flight time to Corpus 
Christi was to be about 34 minutes. Upon reaching FL220, the flight's planned altitude, the flight crew began preparing for the 
descent and approach. Instruction was limited, but the First Officer "was doing a good job of managing the FMC." The Captain 
obtained ATIS information Mike for CRP, which reported the winds were from 010 degrees at 10 knots, 6,000 feet overcast, 10 
miles visibility, and altimeter 30.06 inches. Since the flight was cleared to the CRP VOR, and there was no descent crossing fix 
or altitude to plan a normal descent on, the Captain showed the First Officer how to build a downtrack fix with the EFIS 
computer to create an informational crossing fix altitude. 
 
Descent into Corpus Christi was initiated. The In-Range checklist was completed passing through about 18,000 feet. The flight 
crew briefed on the approach they would be using into CRP and "specifically mentioned about crossing the Ducky [final 
approach] fix at 1,600 feet, but based on the ATIS information, we anticipated picking up the field visually to proceed on in for 
the landing." At about 13,000 feet they contacted Corpus Christi Approach and they were instructed to turn to a heading of 195 
degrees and to continue their descent. At this point the Captain showed the First Officer how to build the approach using the 
FMC. He then showed the First Officer "how to use the intercept course function on the legs page of the FMC CDU (control 
display unit) by bringing Ducky into the active waypoint (1L) and then selecting intercept course (6R) and executing the 
function. This built the final approach course from Ducky on out to the southeast." The flight crew did not properly identify the 
localizer for Runway 31 via the audio Morse code signal. 
 
After descending to 2,000 feet the aircraft was in and out of a broken cloud layer which "somewhat" obscured the flight crew's 
view of the surrounding area. The visibility was about 5 to 6 miles. Approach control instructed the flight to turn to a heading of 
280 degrees and cleared them for the Localizer 31 approach into CRP. The Approach checklist was then completed. The 
Captain did a double check of the NAV AID set up to make sure they had the proper configuration for the approach. He noticed 
the First Officer had not armed the VOR mode of the Mode Control Panel so he pointed out this fact and armed it for him. They 
were about 2.5 miles right of the computed course at that time, still in and out of the clouds. The flight intercepted the localizer 
for Runway 31, "although at the very beginning the course deviation bar did a couple of full scale deflections as if when 
something interfered with the localizer but it settled down right away and we locked on and tracking it inbound about 7 miles 
southeast of Ducky," the final approach fix. After verifying all of the instruments were properly configured for the approach, the 
Captain looked outside and "saw a runway at the northern edge of the cloud they were in and out of." He then said, "runway in 
sight, let's land." The runway also had the number 31 painted on its approach end. The First Officer asked the Captain if they 
"could make the landing from here and the Captain said yes." The autopilot was disconnected and they started a visual descent 
to the runway. The Captain reported the airport in sight to approach control, and he was instructed to contact tower control. 
Tower control cleared the flight to land, and subsequently the aircraft made an uneventful landing on Runway 31 at Cabaniss 
Field. 
 
Cabaniss Field (NGW) is a Navy auxiliary field located 5 nautical miles southeast of Corpus Christi International Airport. Current 
approach plates for the Localizer Runway 31 approach at CRP depicts Cabaniss on the approach course for Runway 31 just 
prior to the final approach fix Ducky. The aircraft remained on the ground for 2.5 hours with one engine running to provide air-
conditioning for the passengers while waiting for ground transportation. 
 
The Captain was employed by People Express on December 6, 1982. When Continental Airlines acquired People Express in 
1986, the Captain had check airman status. On December 15, 1986, the Captain completed Continental's check airman ground 
school. On April 15, 1987, he completed the check airman conversion training for the 737 simulator, and then on August 11, 
1987, he completed check airman proficiency for the 737 series aircraft. The Captain completed his last recurrent training on 
December 7, 1996. He had a total flight time in all aircraft of 10,500 hours, with 8,500 hours in the 737 series aircraft. The 
Captain is based in Newark, New Jersey. 
 
The First Officer was employed by Continental Airlines on July 27, 1987, as a Second Officer. On January 7, 1996, he 
completed initial 737-100/200 First Officer training. His last recurrent training was completed on January 9, 1997. On April 24, 
1997, the First Officer completed the 737-300/500 series aircraft difference ground training, and on May 5, 1997, he completed 
the simulator differences training. He had a total flight time in all aircraft of 13,000 hours, with 1,006 hours in the 737-100/200 
series aircraft. The First Officer is also based in Newark, New Jersey. 
 
According to the ATC voice tape transcripts for the flight, at 1007:47, Continental 1760 reported on Corpus Christi Approach 
Control frequency reporting "with you out of one three thousand for one one thousand with Mike." The controller cleared the 



flight to descend at pilot's discretion to four thousand, and to fly heading one ninety five as a vector for the localizer three one 
approach. Continental 1760 repeated the clearance. At 1015:45, Continental 1760 was cleared to "descend and maintain two 
thousand." Continental 1760 then reported out of 4 thousand feet and repeated the clearance. At 1017:21, the controller 
transmitted, "Continental 1760 six miles from final approach fix, turn right heading 280 maintain at or above two thousand 'til 
established on the localizer, cleared localizer three one approach." Continental 1760 repeated the clearance. Later Continental 
1760 asked the controller if he wanted the flight on the tower frequency. The controller replied, "not yet." At 1018:58, 
Continental 1760 reported the airport in sight. The controller told the flight to contact the tower. Continental 1760 reported on 
tower frequency, "Corpus Tower Continental uh seventeen sixty is with you on final for three one." At 1019:33, Corpus Christi 
tower replied, "Continental seventeen sixty Corpus tower good morning, runway three one cleared to land, wind zero two zero 
at one zero." Two seconds later, the sound of a low-altitude alert was faintly audible on the north radar channel. Then 
Continental 1760 acknowledged the landing clearance. At 1020:52, the radar approach controller called the local controller 
(tower) and asked, "what's the altitude on Continental." The local controller replied, "I don't know, it keeps dropping off." The 
approach controller then replied, "okay I just wanted to make sure he didn't land over there at Cabaniss." About fifteen seconds 
later, at 1021:11, Continental 1760 reported he was "going to gate fifteen," and tower informed them that they had landed at 
Cabaniss Field. 
 
According to the tower Local controller, the traffic at CRP was light with no significant weather (2,300 feet msl overcast and 10 
miles visibility). The Runway 31 localizer approach was in use and Runway 35 was closed for maintenance. The winds were 
from the north at 20 knots. Approximately one half hour before Continental 1760's arrival, a Cessna Citation had requested an 
ILS 13 approach, circle to land on runway 31 at CRP. The request was then made by the North radar controller to the Tower 
controller, who switched the ILS localizer from 31 to 13. After the completion of the approach, the Tower controller did not 
reselect the localizer 31 approach. During the controller change prior to the incident, the outgoing controller did not brief the 
incoming controller on the ILS localizer switch position. 
 
At Corpus Christi CRP, runway 13/31 has an ILS approach to runway 13, and a Localizer approach to runway 31. These 
runways are actually the same runway but opposite directions. According to the FAA there is a national policy for frequency 
spectrum allocation, and there are only 40 ILS frequencies available. To conserve frequencies, both runway directions are 
actually served by different localizer antenna array utilizing the same frequency. To prevent the localizers from functioning 
simultaneously, an interlock feature is installed. The localizer signal provided for each direction is accompanied by its own 
discrete Morse code identifier. The switch for selecting the active approach is located in the Tower Cab and there is no 
indicator in the TRACON (terminal radar approach control) room to indicate to the radar controller which localizer approach is 
selected. 
 
The position and staffing configuration of the TRACON at the time of the incident had all CRP East positions combined at the 
North Radar position. The Valley position and the Flight Data position were also open. Two controller were assigned to the 
Tower Cab; however, at the time of the incident, both the local and ground positions were combined. 
 
Corpus Christi TRACON does not have recorded radar information because the ARTS Automation (ARTS IIA) does not record 
flight track file data. However, the High Speed (ASR37) Computer Print-out Sheet contains a record of low-altitude alerts. At 
1019:39 a low-altitude alert was recorded on code 4775, Continental 1760. 
 
The North radar controller reported that he did not remember hearing the MSAW (minimum safe altitude warning) low-altitude 
alert. There are separate alarms at each radar position for the MSAW, and the volume is preset and not adjustable by the 
controller. 
 
The tower Local controller reported that he would not have heard a low-altitude alert because Continental 1760 had not entered 
the TWAAA (tower aural alarm area). 
 
Naval Air Station Corpus Christi had recorded information on Continental 1760. They were requested to send the Air Traffic 
Control Group an altitude and time listing, and then a distance for the 2 radar "hits" surrounding the 1019:39 low-altitude alert. 
Interpolating the information, at the time the low-altitude alert occurred, the aircraft, Continental 1760, was about 2.4 miles from 
the end of the runway at Cabaniss at an altitude of about 950 feet. 


